
BEARY LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE 

A B C D E F G H I J K
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FORT SHERIDAN CEMETERY $340.00 28 $9,520.00 $340.00 28 $9,520.00 $350.00 28 $9,800.00 $28,840.00

GENERAL OFFICES $142.00 28 $3,976.00 $142.00 28 $3,976.00 $147.00 28 $4,116.00 $12,068.00

HASTINGS LAKE FP $250.00 28 $7,000.00 $250.00 28 $7,000.00 $258.00 28 $7,224.00 $21,224.00

HERON CREEK FP $160.00 28 $4,480.00 $160.00 28 $4,480.00 $165.00 28 $4,620.00 $13,580.00

VAN PATTEN WOODS FP $873.00 28 $24,444.00 $873.00 28 $24,444.00 $903.00 28 $25,284.00 $74,172.00

BID RESULTS - TURF MOWING AND TRIMMING - BIDS OPENED 2/21/17

$49,420.00 TOTAL YEAR 3 $51,044.00 $149,884.00

YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 3

TOTAL YEAR 1 $49,420.00 TOTAL YEAR 2
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FISHER BURTON COMPANY 
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FORT SHERIDAN CEMETERY $425.00 28 $11,900.00 $425.00 28 $11,900.00 $425.00 28 $11,900.00 $35,700.00

GENERAL OFFICES $135.00 28 $3,780.00 $135.00 28 $3,780.00 $135.00 28 $3,780.00 $11,340.00

HASTINGS LAKE FP $222.00 28 $6,216.00 $222.00 28 $6,216.00 $222.00 28 $6,216.00 $18,648.00

HERON CREEK FP $235.00 28 $6,580.00 $235.00 28 $6,580.00 $235.00 28 $6,580.00 $19,740.00

VAN PATTEN WOODS FP NO BID 28 NO BID NO BID 28 NO BID NO BID 28 NO BID NO BID

$85,428.00

YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 3

TOTAL YEAR 1 TOTAL YEAR 2 TOTAL YEAR 3$28,476.00 $28,476.00 $28,476.00
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GRUNDSTRON LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE 
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FORT SHERIDAN CEMETERY $448.00 28 $12,544.00 $456.00 28 $12,768.00 $465.00 28 $13,020.00 $38,332.00

GENERAL OFFICES $320.00 28 $8,960.00 $325.00 28 $9,100.00 $330.00 28 $9,240.00 $27,300.00

HASTINGS LAKE FP $280.00 28 $7,840.00 $285.00 28 $7,980.00 $290.00 28 $8,120.00 $23,940.00

HERON CREEK FP $280.00 28 $7,840.00 $285.00 28 $7,980.00 $290.00 28 $8,120.00 $23,940.00

VAN PATTEN WOODS FP $1,344.00 28 $37,632.00 $1,370.00 28 $38,360.00 $1,395.00 28 $39,060.00 $115,052.00

$76,188.00 TOTAL YEAR 3 $77,560.00 $228,564.00

YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 3

TOTAL YEAR 1 $74,816.00 TOTAL YEAR 2
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LANGTON GROUP 
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FORT SHERIDAN CEMETERY $400.00 28 $11,200.00 $400.00 28 $11,200.00 $400.00 28 $11,200.00 $33,600.00

GENERAL OFFICES $94.50 28 $2,646.00 $94.50 28 $2,646.00 $94.50 28 $2,646.00 $7,938.00

HASTINGS LAKE FP $224.00 28 $6,272.00 $224.00 28 $6,272.00 $224.00 28 $6,272.00 $18,816.00

HERON CREEK FP $171.85 28 $4,811.80 $171.85 28 $4,811.80 $171.85 28 $4,811.80 $14,435.40

VAN PATTEN WOODS FP $840.00 28 $23,520.00 $840.00 28 $23,520.00 $840.00 28 $23,520.00 $70,560.00

$145,349.40TOTAL YEAR 1 $48,449.80 TOTAL YEAR 2 $48,449.80 TOTAL YEAR 3 $48,449.80

YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 3
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